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ANUBHUTI ENGLISH
MEDIUM SCHOOL 

Anubhuti English Medium School was conceived by 
Bhavarlal H. Jain and instituted in Jalgaon to provide 
quality English Medium Education to underprivileged 
children. The school was opened on 11th July, 2011. 
It started with 180 students in Classes I and II. Today 
the school has 415 students in class I to IX.
Co-curricular activities of music, dance and fi ne arts 
are a regular part of schooling. The school provides 
nutritious food three times a day. Students are also 
provided with all clothes, books, educational material 
and medical attention. Anubhuti Residential School’s 
senior students visit Anubhuti English Medium 
School to interact with the children. The two groups 
of children put up entertainment and demos for each 
other.
This integration of children from different social strata 
in an educational set-up are mutually benefi cial – the 
positive social and economic ramifi cations of this 
would be unfolded years later, as these children 
grow.
Anubhuti English Medium School provides quality 
education with facilities comparable to the best 
schools. The school is about experimental learning, 
i.e. learning by doing. The concepts are taught, 
revised, tested and
reinforced through activities, educational games, 
projects, group discussions & fi eld visits. Classrooms 
have specially designed children friendly furniture. 
An excellent library stocked with children’s books and 

magazines, a well-equipped computer and science 
lab are also provided. Co-curricular activities such 
as music, dance, art, craft and fi ne arts are a regular 
part of schooling.
The Anubhuti English Medium School experiment 
is to investigate whether removal of illiteracy by 
imparting quality education will remove the greatest 
obstacle in upward social mobility. We have initiated 
an educational fair which provides a platform for 
every aspect of holistic education, academics, arts & 
crafts, performing arts, sports and most importantly 
nurtures the young minds to be entrepreneurs i.e. 
job-creators rather than job-seekers.
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